
Such a great place. Everyone is part of 

an amazing team. The nursing staff 

is very attentive to every need of my 

family member. Any questions regarding 

their care were addressed quickly and 

thoroughly. Management was available 

to answer any and all questions.



Unlike traditional nursing homes, 
Hearthstone Nursing & Rehabilitation 
specializes in caring for high acuity 
short-term patients and providing 
compassionate long-term care. Patients 
who have recently been hospitalized, 
undergone surgery, received hip or knee 
replacement surgeries, or have a chronic 
illness will find an ideal community with 
comprehensive care and support services 
delivered by professional caregivers and 
therapy teams. 

Hearthstone’s brand new Memory Care 
program focuses on the individual, 
creating an environment that fosters 
independence and restores the self-
esteem and dignity they have earned 
throughout their lives. Sensitive to the 
impact memory loss has on every person 
and their support system, Hearthstone’s 
memory care nurses and therapists work 
diligently with physicians to provide a plan 
of care for each resident. 

Residents thrive in the loving, safe, 
and secure environment with an array 
of amenities and engaging programs.



During the COVID-19 pandemic, 
Hearthstone stepped up to respond to 
community needs and opened the first 
Specialized Isolation Unit in the area to 
care for senior patients as they were 
discharged from area hospitals. 

SKILLED NURSING SERVICES 
aa	On-site occupational, physical, speech and 

wellness therapy

aa	Complex disease management (diabetes, 
stroke recovery, CHF, COPD)

aa	Highly skilled wound care management

aa	Medication management

aa	Joint replacement therapy

aa	IV therapy

aa	Respite Care

aa	Specialized nutritional care

aa	Exciting and engaging activities

aa	Hospice/Palliative Care

aa	Tracheostomy care

aa	Beauty Shop on-site

MEMORY CARE
aa	Secured, all-female Memory Care unit

aa	Cognitive-based and person-centered 
activity program

aa	Dementia/Alzheimer’s trained staff

aa	Psychosocial support

aaAssistance with all aspects of daily living

aa 24-Hour skilled nursing services

INSURANCE
Hearthstone accepts most major insurance 
plans, Medicare, Medicaid, and pending 
Medicaid.
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Scan this QR 
code with your 
phone to visit 
our website.

 

  
 
 

  

401 Oakwood Boulevard  Round
  Rock, TX 78681

Phone:  512-388-7494 
Admissions:  512-789-5026

Fax:  201-740-0962

contacthearthstone@
  caradayhealth.com

caradayhealth.com/hearthstone


